

### TABULATION

ANNUAL BIDS # 2620 - ROAD DRAINAGE MATERIALS  
 AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON DECEMBER 15, 2015 AT 11:00 A.M.  
 FROM: MARCH 23, 2016 TO: MARCH 22, 2017 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL  
 OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

VENDOR'S NAME ADDRESS DESCRIPTION	CONTECH CONSTRUCTION 2201 WEST ROYAL LANE, S# 170, IRVING, TX. 76063 (972) 690-2000	RIO VALLEY PIPE - CAPA 3609 W. PALMA VISTA DR., PALMVIEW, TX. 78572 (956) 432-0800
A CORRUGATED METAL PIPE, ASPHALT COATED DELIVERED TO THE JOB SITE		
(1) 18" X 2 2/3 X 1/2" CORRUGATIONS - 18 G	PRICE PER L.F. → \$ 15.20	PRICE PER L.F. NO BID
(2) 24" X 2 2/3 X 1/2" CORRUGATIONS - 16 G	→ \$ 19.00	NO BID
(3) 30" X 2 2/3 X 1/2" CORRUGATIONS - 16 G	→ \$ 23.75	NO BID
(4) 36" X 2 3/4 X 1/2" CORRUGATIONS - 14 G	→ \$ 40.70	NO BID
(5) 48" X 2 2/3 X 1/2" CORRUGATIONS - 14 G	→ \$ 55.00	NO BID
(6) 60" X 2 2/3 X 1/2" CORRUGATIONS - 12 G	→ \$ 91.30	NO BID
(7) 72" X 3" X 1" CORRUGATIONS - 12 G	→ \$ 124.30	NO BID
(8) 84" X 3" X 1" CORRUGATIONS - 12 G	→ \$ 144.10	NO BID
(9) 96" X 3" X 1" CORRUGATIONS - 10G	→ \$ 166.10	NO BID
(10) # BAND COUPLER COMPLETE W/ BOLTS	PRICE PER EACH → \$ 22.80	PRICE PER EACH NO BID
(A) 18"	→ \$ 28.60	NO BID
(B) 24"	→ \$ 35.63	NO BID
(C) 30"	→ \$ 61.05	NO BID
(D) 36"	→ \$ 82.60	NO BID
(E) 48"	→ \$ 182.60	NO BID
(F) 60"	→ \$ 248.60	NO BID
(G) 72"	→ \$ 288.20	NO BID
(H) 84"	→ \$ 332.20	NO BID
(I) 96"		NO BID

RECOMMENDATION →

\*1 - FREIGHT \$ 995.00 PR FLATBED LOAD

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT PROPOSALS RECEIVED:

MICHAEL FORBES, PURCHASING AGENT DATE 12/31/15

Carlos Sanchez 01/04/16  
 CARLOS SANCHEZ COUNTY ENGINEERING DEPT DATI

Ruben Gonzalez 12/31/15  
 RUBEN GONZALEZ PUBLIC WORKS DATE

Awarded by Comm. Ct. 1/12/16

**TABULATION**

ANNUAL BIDS # 2520 - ROAD DRAINAGE MATERIALS  
 AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON DECEMBER 16, 2015 AT 11:00 A.M.  
 FROM: MARCH 23, 2016 TO: MARCH 22, 2017 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL  
 OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

VENDOR'S NAME ADDRESS DESCRIPTION		CONTECH CONSTRUCTION 2201 WEST ROYAL LANE, SN 170, IRVING, TX. 75063 (972) 590-2000	RIO VALLEY PIPE - CAPA 3609 W. PALMA VISTA DR., PALMVIEW, TX. 78572 (956) 432-0800
<b>B</b>	CONCRETE PIPE W/JOINTING MATERIALS TO REINFORCED T & G - CLASS III	PRICE PER L.F.	PRICE PER L.F.
	(A) 18" / X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 17.65
	(B) 24" / X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 22.95
	(C) 30" / X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 38.10
	(D) 36" / X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 62.50
	(E) 42" / X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 66.95
	(F) 48" / X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 89.50
	(G) 54" / X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 105.10
<b>C</b>	CONCRETE PIPE REINFORCED GASKET (Flex Joint)- CLASS III	PRICE PER L.F.	PRICE PER L.F.
	A) 18" X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 20.30
	B) 24" X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 26.80
	C) 30" X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 38.10
	D) 36" X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 62.20
	E) 42" X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 66.95
	F) 48" X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 90.90
	G) 54" X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 108.30
	H) 60" X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 135.80
	I) 72" X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 187.50

RECOMMENDATION →  
 I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT PROPOSALS RECEIVED:

*Michael Forbes*  
 MICHAEL FORBES, PURCHASING AGENT DATE 12/31/15

*Carlos Sanchez* 01/04/16  
 CARLOS SANCHEZ COUNTY ENGINEERING DEPT DATE  
*Ruben Gonzalez* 12/31/15  
 RUBEN GONZALEZ PUBLIC WORKS DATE

Awarded by Comm. Ct. 1/12/16

## TABULATION

ANNUAL BIDS #2620 - ROAD DRAINAGE MATERIALS  
 AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON DECEMBER 16, 2016 AT 11:00 A.M.  
 FROM: MARCH 23, 2018 TO: MARCH 22, 2017 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL  
 OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

VENDOR'S NAME ADDRESS DESCRIPTION	CONTECH CONSTRUCTION 2201 WEST ROYAL LANE, S# 170, IRVING, TX. 75063 (972) 590-2000	RIO VALLEY PIPE - CAPA 3609 W. PALMA VISTA DR., PALMVIEW, TX. 78572 (956) 432-0600
D. CONCRETE DRAIN INLETS TYPE "AA" TO CONFORM W/ASTM C-478	PRICE PER EACH	PRICE PER EACH
A) 3' X 6' X 3'	NO BID	
B) 3' X 5' X 4'	NO BID	→ \$ 872.50
C) 3' X 5' X 5'	NO BID	→ \$ 905.00
D) 3' X 5' X 6'	NO BID	→ \$ 1,004.80
E) 3' X 5' X 7'	NO BID	→ \$ 1,135.85
F) 3' X 5' X 8'	NO BID	→ \$ 1,261.90
G) TYPE "AA" INLET TOP W/ SIDEWALK RING & COVER	NO BID	→ \$ 1,370.40
	NO BID	→ \$ 474.70
E. CONCRETE DRAIN INLETS TYPE "CC" TO CONFORM W/ASTM C-478	PRICE PER EACH	PRICE PER EACH
A) 3' X 5' X 3' W/ 2 grates	NO BID	→ \$ 1,147.80
B) 3' X 5' X 4' W/ 2 grates	NO BID	→ \$ 1,160.30
C) 3' X 5' X 5' W/ 2 grates	NO BID	→ \$ 1,280.10
D) 3' X 5' X 6' W/ 2 grates	NO BID	→ \$ 1,411.15
E) 3' X 5' X 7' W/ 2 grates	NO BID	→ \$ 1,537.20
F) 3' X 5' X 8' W/ 2 grates	NO BID	→ \$ 1,646.70
G) TYPE "CC" MOD INLET GRATES - 2 PER INLET	NO BID	→ \$ 750.00

RECOMMENDATION →  
 I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT PROPOSALS RECEIVED:

*Michael Forbes*  
 MICHAEL FORBES, PURCHASING AGENT DATE 12/31/15

*Carlos Sanchez* 01/04/16  
 CARLOS SANCHEZ COUNTY ENGINEERING DEPT DATA  
*Ruben Gonzalez* 12/31/15  
 RUBEN GONZALEZ PUBLIC WORKS DATE

Awarded by Comm. Ct. 1/12/16



## TABULATION

ANNUAL BIDS # 2520 - ROAD DRAINAGE MATERIALS  
 AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON DECEMBER 16, 2015 AT 11:00 A.M.  
 FROM: MARCH 23, 2016 TO: MARCH 22, 2017 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL  
 OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

VENDOR'S NAME ADDRESS DESCRIPTION	CONTECH CONSTRUCTION 2201 WEST ROYAL LANE, S# 170, IRVING, TX. 75063 (872) 590-2000	RIO VALLEY PIPE - CAPA 3609 W. PALMA VISTA DR., PALMVIEW, TX. 78572 (956) 432-0600
G. CONCRETE PIPE REINFORCED (T & G) CLASS III		
A) 12" X 8 L.F.	NO BID	→ \$ 12.40 PR/L.F.
B) 12" X 8 L.F. REINFORCED GASKET (FLEX JOINT)	NO BID	→ \$ 16.00 PR/L.F.
MISC OFF	0%	4%

RECOMMENDATION →

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT PROPOSALS RECEIVED:

Michael Forbes 12/31/15  
 MICHAEL FORBES, PURCHASING AGENT DATE

Carlos Sanchez 01/04/16  
 CARLOS SANCHEZ COUNTY ENGINEERING DEPT. DATE  
Ruben Gonzalez 12/31/15  
 RUBEN GONZALEZ PUBLIC WORKS DATE

Awarded by Comm. Ct. 1/12/16