

TABULATION

ANNUAL BID # 2430 - MOSQUITO INSECTICIDE

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON: JANUARY 27, 2015 AT 11:00 A.M.

FROM: MARCH 16, 2015 TO: MARCH 15, 2016 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.

VENDOR'S NAME & ADDRESS	TARGET SPECIALTY 5042 SERVICE CENTER DR, SAN ANTONIO, TX. 78218 (800) 925-3922	UNIVAR USA 402 McBRIDE LANE, CORPUS CHRISTI, TX. 78408 (381) 954-2181	CLARKE MOSQUITO 675 SIDWELL COURT, ST. CHARLES, IL. 60174 (800) 323-5727	ADAPCO 550 AERO LANE, SANFORD, FL. 32771 (800) 367-0659
DESCRIPTION	PR/GAL	PR/GAL	PR/GAL	PR/GAL
1. 18% resmethrin, 34% Piperonyl Butoxide - 5 gal/pail	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	→ \$479.48
2. 4% resmethrin, 12% Piperonyl Butoxide - 55 gal/drum	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	→ \$473.44
3. Oil-based Permethrin RTU, min. 4% Permethrin and 8% Piperonyl Butoxide - Ready to Use (55 gal) drum	NO BID	NO BID	\$74.00	→ \$33.00
4. Oil-based pyrethroids - min. 1.5% Oil-based Permethrin, 7.5% Piperonyl Butoxide - (Ready to use) 55 gal/drum	NO BID	NO BID	→ \$51.83	NO BID
5. Oil-based Permethrin RTU, min. 4% Permethrin and 4% Piperonyl Butoxide - Ready to Use (55 gal) Drum	16.79 *2	\$18.48	\$48.49	→ \$17.10
6. Oil-based Permethrin RTU, min. 4% Permethrin and 4% Piperonyl Butoxide - Ready to Use - 2 X 2.5 gal	\$21.50	\$18.48	\$52.28	→ \$17.35
7. Oil-based Permethrin RTU, min. 4% Permethrin and 4% Piperonyl Butoxide - Ready to Use - (275 gals) Mir	\$16.79	\$18.05	\$47.62	→ \$18.86
8. Oil-based Permethrin Concentrate, min. 30% Permethrin, 30% Piperonyl Butoxide - 5 gal/pail	59.00 *2	→ \$59.19	\$186.11	\$94.00
9. Oil-based Permethrin Concentrate min. 31% Permethrin, 66% Piperonyl Butoxide - per/gal	\$92.40	→ \$91.10	\$221.69	\$125.00
10. 1.5 lb/gal Chlorpyrifos, RTU- 55 gal drum	24.74	→ \$24.05	\$64.74	\$30.55
11. Altosid Briquets (220 cnt.) - 150 days (Open Market Price Increases allowed)	\$697.40	→ \$697.40	\$697.40	\$697.40
12. Altosid Briquets (400 cnt.) - 30 days (Open Market Price Increases allowed)	\$440.00	→ \$440.00	\$440.00	\$440.00
13. Bactimos Briquets (100 pr/box) - 30 days	→ \$67.00	\$68.00	\$101.09	\$73.89
14. 6% Bacillus sphaericus, Bacillus thuringiensis 1% (200 cnt) 45 day Briquets	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	→ \$243.65
15. EPA Approved Diluent Oil for Mosquito Control - 55 gal/drum	\$8.10	\$7.15	\$20.10	→ \$6.99

*1 - Local Vendor 3%, stock in Hgm.

*2 - not on approved list of equivalents

not needed by Com Cont 2/12/15

RECOMMENDATION

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:

Michael Forbes
MICHAEL FORBES, ASST. AUDITOR / PURCHASING DATE 2-4-15

Gustavo Olivares
GUSTAVO OLIVARES, ENVIRONMENTAL HEALTH DEPT. DATE 2-4-15