

ANNUAL BID : TIRES - ON & OFF ROAD # 1997

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON NOVEMBER 17, 2008 AT 5:00 P.M.

FROM: AWARD DATE TO: DECEMBER 15, 2009 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE - (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR EACH RENEWAL.

VENDOR'S NAME & ADDRESS		FIRESTONE 1054 FM 802, BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78521 (956)541-5556	THE TIRE CORRAL 800 ASH, S# 1 McALLEN, TX. 78501 (956)631-7746	GRAY'S WHOLESALE 201 N. RUPERT ST, FT. WORTH, TX. 76107 (800)792-8749	A - Z TIRE 812 W 4TH AMARILLO, TX 79101	GCR 1402 N. 77 SUNSHINE ST HARLINGEN, TX. 7855 (956)423-0448
DESCRIPTION						
CATEGORY A : VEHICLE TIRES						
	QTY. / YR	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
1. P205/75R14 HT	2	\$80.00	NO BID	\$ 113.88	\$90.00	\$101.38
2. P215/70R14 HT	6	\$252.00	NO BID	\$ 339.84	\$330.00	\$340.44
3. P215/70R15 HT	2	\$92.00	NO BID	\$ 117.58	\$108.00	\$116.74
4. P215/75R15 HT	2	\$100.00	NO BID	\$ 127.56	\$100.00	\$100.04
5. P215/75R15 AT	2	\$143.16	NO BID	\$ 156.46	\$144.00	\$163.16
6. P225/60R16 HT	137	\$6,850.00	\$10,542.15	\$ 8,422.76	\$6,713.00	\$6,921.24
7. LT225/70R14 HT	4	\$305.28	NO BID	\$ 332.52	\$280.00	\$322.16
8.P225/70R15 HT	70	\$4,200.00	\$5,246.50	\$ 5,469.80	\$3,920.00	\$4,724.30
9. P225/75R15 HT	2	\$107.60	NO BID	\$ 145.88	\$114.00	\$127.60
10. P225/75R16 HT	4	\$324.80	NO BID	\$ 331.56	\$272.00	\$343.64
11. P235/70R15 HT	43	\$2,563.66	NO BID	\$ 3,482.57	\$2,924.00	\$2,993.66

Recommendation →

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:

MICHAEL FORBES, ASST. AUDITOR / PURCHASING DATE

LEE LOZANO - FLEET MAINT.

TABULATION

ANNUAL BID TIRES - ON & OFF ROAD # 1997

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON NOVEMBER 17, 2008 AT 5:00 P.M.

FROM: AWARD DATE TO: DECEMBER 15, 2009 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE - (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR EACH RENEWAL.

VENDOR'S NAME & ADDRESS		FIRESTONE 1054 FM 802, BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78521 (956)541-5556	THE TIRE CORRAL 800 ASH, S# 1 McALLEN, TX. 78501 (956)631-7746	GRAY'S WHOLESale 201 N. RUPERT ST, FT. WORTH, TX. 76107 (800)792-8749	A - Z TIRE 812 W 4TH AMARILLO, TX 79101	GCR 1402 N. 77 SUNSHINE ST HARLINGEN, TX. 7855 (956)423-0448
DESCRIPTION						
CATEGORY A : VEHICLE TIRES						
	QTY. / YR	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
12. P235/70R16 HT	4	\$322.20	\$380.00	\$356.92	\$308.00	\$322.20
13. P235/70R16 AT	4	\$301.40	NO BID	\$342.52	\$328.00	\$301.40
14. LT235/75R15 HT	2	\$159.36	NO BID	\$167.16	\$178.00	\$153.40
15. LT235/75R15 AT	2	\$180.66	NO BID	\$167.96	\$178.00	\$156.60
16. P235/75R15 HT	20	\$1,075.80	\$1,900.00	\$1,508.80	\$1,000.00	\$1,220.00
17. P235/75R15 AT	12	\$1,114.32	\$1,176.00	\$1,187.88	\$840.00	\$1,114.32
18. LT235/85R16 HT	2	\$155.00	NO BID	\$169.46	\$160.00	\$155.00
19. LT245/75R16 HT	20	\$1,732.00	\$1,860.00	\$1,775.60	\$1,600.00	\$1,732.00
20. P245/75R16 HT	10	\$918.50	\$958.50	\$931.80	\$800.00	\$918.50
21. LT265/70R17 AT	7	\$616.70	\$805.00	\$778.26	\$952.00	\$676.90
22. LT265/70R17 HT	4	\$344.60	\$452.00	\$435.12	\$544.00	\$384.00
23. LT265/75R16 AT	3	\$244.35	\$289.50	\$278.19	\$279.00	\$244.35
24. LT265/75R16 HT	4	\$326.20	\$375.00	\$359.92	\$368.00	\$326.20
25. LT265/75R16 AT	5	\$407.25	\$482.50	\$463.65	\$465.00	\$407.25
26. LT30/950R15 HT	3	\$243.09	\$345.00	\$285.99	\$225.00	\$273.09
27. LT30/950R15 AT	3	\$250.56	\$359.85	\$289.74	\$225.00	\$296.58
TOTAL PRICE		→ \$23,410.49	INC.	\$ 28,539.38	\$23,445.00	\$24,936.15
MISC. TIRES % DISCOUNT						
OFF CATALOG LIST PRICE		15%	N/A	VARIOUS	0%	7%

Recommendation →

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:

MICHAEL FORBES, ASST. AUDITOR / PURCHASING DATE

LEE LOZANO - FLEET MAINT.

TABULATION

ANNUAL BID TIRES - ON & OFF ROAD # 1997

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON NOVEMBER 17, 2008 AT 5:00 P.M.

FROM: AWARD DATE TO: DECEMBER 15, 2009 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE - (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR EACH RENEWAL.

VENDOR'S NAME & ADDRESS		FIRESTONE 1054 FM 802, BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78521 (956)541-5556	THE TIRE CORRAL 800 ASH, S# 1 McALLEN, TX. 78501 (956)631-7746	GRAY'S WHOLESAL 201 N. RUPERT ST, FT. WORTH, TX. 76107 (800)792-8749	A - Z TIRE 812 W 4TH AMARILLO, TX 79101	GCR 1402 N. 77 SUNSHINE ST HARLINGEN, TX. 7855 (956)423-0448
DESCRIPTION						
CATEGORY B : PATROL POLICE PURSUIT TIRES						
	QTY. / YR	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
A. P225-60R16	300	\$18,000.00	\$23,085.00	\$22,185.00	\$26,100.00	\$20,325.00
B. P225-70R15	200	\$9,000.00	\$14,990.00	\$14,390.00	*NOBID	\$13,152.00
C. P235-55R17	200	\$18,000.00	\$19,000.00	\$18,200.00	\$19,800.00	\$18,000.00
TOTAL PRICE		→ \$45,000.00	\$57,075.00	\$54,775.00	*\$54,900.00	\$51,477.00

*#B INC \$9000

Recommendation →

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:

MICHAEL FORBES, ASST. AUDITOR / PURCHASING DATE

LEE LOZANO - FLEET MAINT.

TABULATION

ANNUAL BID TIRES - ON & OFF ROAD # 1997

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON NOVEMBER 17, 2008 AT 5:00 P.M.

FROM: AWARD DATE TO: DECEMBER 15, 2009 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE - (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR EACH RENEWAL.

VENDOR'S NAME & ADDRESS DESCRIPTION		→ FIRESTONE 1054 FM 802, BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78521 (956)541-5556	THE TIRE CORRAL 800 ASH, S# I McALLEN, TX. 78501 (956)631-7746	GRAY'S WHOLESALE 201 N. RUPERT ST, FT. WORTH, TX. 76107 (800)792-8749	A - Z TIRE 812 W 4TH AMARILLO, TX 79101	GCR 1402 N. 77 SUNSHINE ST HARLINGEN, TX. 7855 (956)423-0448
CATEGORY C: OFF ROAD & HEAVY EQUIP. TRUCK TIRES		TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
QTY. / YR						
1. GRADER TIRE 14X24 12P	5	\$ 2,517.50	\$1,875.00	\$2,012.10	\$1,525.00	\$2,366.45
2. GRADER TIRE 17X25 12P	5	\$ 3,021.00	\$2,425.00	\$2,580.60	\$2,715.00	\$3,153.60
3. BACKHOE TIRE 11LX16 10P	4	\$ 458.56	\$492.00	\$529.88	\$416.00	\$458.56
4. BACKHOE TIRE 17.5LRX24 G/8P	4	\$ 1,880.00	\$1,440.00	\$2,273.64	\$1,200.00	\$1,430.92
5. TRACTOR TIRE 7.5 X 16 8P	4	\$ 476.00	NO BID	\$340.68	\$332.00	\$327.60
6. TRACTOR TIRE 10X16 8P	4	\$ 700.00	\$596.00	\$420.72	\$500.00	\$451.48
7. TRACTOR TIRE 18.4X30 6P	4	\$ 2,556.00	\$1,599.80	\$1,739.80	\$1,560.00	\$1,548.40
8. TRACTOR TIRE 18.4X34 6P	4	\$2,759.20	NO BID	\$1,866.24	\$1,700.00	\$1,759.28
9. HEAVY TRUCK 10.0XR20 G/14 HT	5	\$925.00	\$1,320.00	\$1,382.30	\$1,010.00	\$1,144.85
10. HEAVY TRUCK 10.0XR22.5 G/14 HT	5	\$975.00	NO BID	\$1,022.30	\$1,110.00	\$1,025.00
11. HEAVY TRUCK 11.0XR22.5 G/14 HT	4	\$916.00	\$998.00	\$813.84	\$816.00	\$876.00
12. HEAVY TRUCK 11.0XR22.5 H/16 HT	4	\$960.00	\$1,020.00	\$833.76	\$864.00	\$896.00
TOTAL PRICE		\$ 18,144.26	\$11,765.80	\$15,815.86	\$13,748.00	\$15,438.14
SPECIAL DELIVERY CHARGES		0	0	0	0	0
GRAND TOTAL PRICE		\$86,554.00	INC.	\$99,129.00	\$92,093.00	\$91,851.00
MISC. TIRES % OFF LIST PRICE		15%	N/A	VARIOUS	0%	0%

Recommendation →

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:

MICHAEL FORBES, ASST. AUDITOR / PURCHASING DATE

LEE LOZANO. / FLEET MAINTENANCE DEPT.