

TABULATION

BUILDING SUPPLIES: ELECTRICAL - ANNUAL BID # 2000-2

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON: DECEMBER 7, 2010 AT 10:00 A.M.

FROM: JANUARY 23, 2011 TO: JANUARY 22, 2012 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR (ONE) ADDITIONAL YE

VENDOR ADDRESS				ELECTRIC FIXTURE 810 E. 11th. St, Brownsville, Tx. 78522 (956)546-2401
DESCRIPTION		U/M	Qty pr/yr.	Total pr/ yr.
PRIMARY VENDOR - ELECTRICAL				
<b>I.</b>	<b>FUSES</b>			
1	FRS-R-30 600 V RK TD	30	EA	\$180.00
2	SC-15 600V CLASS G	30	EA	\$52.50
3	FRN-R-30 250V TD	60	EA	\$276.00
4	SC-30 300V CLASS G	30	EA	\$52.50
5	SC-20 600V CLASS G	20	EA	\$35.00
6	KTK-R-15 600V MINITURE	30	EA	\$255.00
7	KTK-10 600V MINITURE	50	EA	\$125.00
8	MDL-3 250V SMALL DIM 3A 250V SLOW BLOW	30	EA	\$18.00
9	FRN-R-60 250V RK5 TD 60A	60	EA	\$270.00
10	KTK-R-10 600V MINITURE	30	EA	\$225.00
11	FRN-R-45 250V RK5 TD	20	EA	\$52.00
12	FRN-R-150 250V RK5	20	EA	\$227.20
13	FRS-R-100 600V RK TD	30	EA	\$570.00
14	FRS-R-200 600V RK5	20	EA	\$400.00
	SUB-TOTAL ITEM I.			\$2,738.20
<b>II</b>	<b>SQUARE D BREAKERS</b>			
1	QO120SP-120/240V-20C	30	EA	NO BID
2	D223NRB 100A-240V RT	5	EA	NO BID
3	QO220 2P-120/240V-20A CB	30	EA	NO BID
4	QO250 2P-120/240V-50A CB	15	EA	NO BID
5	QOB120 SP-120/240V-20A CB	20	EA	NO BID
6	QO115 SP-120/240V-15A CB	50	EA	NO BID
7	QO130 SP-120/240V-30A CB	50	EA	NO BID
8	HOM260 2P-120/240V-60A CB	20	EA	NO BID
9	QO2020 SP-2020A CB	15	EA	NO BID
10	QO816L100S SFC LD-CNTR	10	EA	NO BID
11	QO112L125G LD CNTR	10	EA	NO BID
12	QO120L125G LD-CNTR	5	EA	NO BID
13	QO315 3P-240V-15A CB	15	EA	NO BID
14	D221NRB 30A-240V3SN	5	EA	NO BID
15	D224NRB 200A-240V RT	5	EA	NO BID
16	D321NRB 30A-240V 4SN	5	EA	NO BID
17	QO280 2P-120/240V-80A CB	5	EA	NO BID
18	PK9GTA GRNDG BAR KIT	15	EA	NO BID
19	D223N 100A-240V-3SN	5	EA	NO BID
20	D322NRB 60A-240V-4SN-RT SW	5	EA	NO BID
21	QO370 3P-240V-70A CB	10	EA	NO BID
22	QO230 2P-120/240V-30A CB	15	EA	NO BID
	SUB-TOTAL ITEM II			NO BID

Approved by  
Commissioner's Clerk  
12/21/2010

RECOMMENDATION →

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:

MICHAEL FORBES, ASST. AUDITOR PURCHASING DATE 12/15/10

MARCELINO IBARRA - BUILDING MAINTENANCE MANAGER

(Continued) Primary Vendor - Electrical				ELECTRIC FIXTURE 810 E. 11th. St, Brownsville, Tx. 78522 (956)546-2401
	U/M	Qty pr/yr.		Total pr/ yr.
<b>III CUTLER- HAMMER &amp; ITE BREAKERS</b>				
1	CH120 SP-20A-120V CB	50	EA	\$225.00
2	CH250 2P-50A-240V CB	25	EA	\$206.25
3	CH230 2P-30A-240V CB	30	EA	\$247.50
4	CIRCUIT PANEL & COVERS (ITE)		EA	NO BID
5	CIRCUIT PANEL & COVERS (CUTLER)		EA	NO BID
6	LOAD CENTERS (ITE)		EA	NO BID
7	LOAD CENTERS (CUTLER-HAMMER)		EA	NO BID
<b>SUB-TOTAL ITEM III</b>				<b>\$675.75</b>

<b>IV EMERGENCY LIGHT FIXTURES</b>				
	CCS WHT EMERGENCY LIGHTING UNIT	10	EA	\$122.50
<b>SUB-TOTAL ITEM IV</b>				<b>\$122.50</b>

<b>V MISCELLANEOUS</b>				
1	312 BULK YELLOW WIRE CONNECTORS 500	2000	EA	\$160.00
2	512 BULK RED WIRE CONNECTORS 500 BAG	2000	EA	\$200.00
3	30-273 SIZE 73B ORANGE WIRE CONNECTORS	1000	EA	\$120.00
4	3/4" ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING	2000	EA	\$700.00
5	1" ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING	1000	EA	\$400.00
6	1/2" EMT ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING	3000	FT	\$570.00
7	1/2" DIECAST SET SCREW	300	EA	\$45.00
8	1/2" ONE HOLE ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING	300	EA	\$36.00
9	V500 RACEWAY WIREMOLD TUBING	300	EA	\$36.00
10	3/4" ONE HOLE ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING	300	EA	\$30.00
11	3/8" BX METALLIC CABLE CONNECTORS	100	EA	\$30.00
12	3/4" EMT DIECAST SET SCREW CONNECTORS	300	EA	\$75.00
13	1/2" EMT DIECAST SET SCREW CONNECTORS	300	EA	\$60.00
14	V504 WIREMOLD TUBING 2 HOLE STRAPS	50	EA	\$2.50
15	CR20 NEMA5 20A IVORY DUPLEX	100	EA	\$135.00
16	1/2" LIQUID TITE FLEXIBLE TUBING	300	EA	\$45.00
17	V700 RACEWAY WIREMOLD TUBING	100	EA	\$15.00
18	1" EMT DIECAST COMPRESSION COUPLINS	50	EA	\$12.50
19	5/8" RAISE SINGLE POLE PLASTER RINGS	50	EA	\$10.00

RECOMMENDATION →

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:

MICHAEL FORBES, ASST. AUDITOR PURCHASING DATE 12/15/10

MARCELINO IBARRA - BUILDING MAINTENANCE MANAGER

Approved by Com. Ct  
12/21/2010

BUILDING SUPPLIES: ELECTRICAL - ANNUAL BID # 2000-2  
 AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON: DECEMBER 7, 2010 AT 10:00 A.M.  
 FROM: JANUARY 23, 2011 TO: JANUARY 22, 2012 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR (ONE) ADDITIONAL YE

(Continued) Primary Vendor - Electrical				ELECTRIC FIXTURE 810 E. 11th. St, Brownsville, Tx. 78522 (956)546-2401
V.	MISCELLANEOUS (CONTINUED)	U/M	Qty pr/yr.	Total pr/ yr.
20	1/2" FEMALE CONDUIT CONNECTORS	100	EA	\$15.00
21	4 X 4 BLANK COVER PLATES	100	EA	\$30.00
22	1/2" REGULAR HANDYBOXES WITH	100	EA	\$22.00
23	SINGLE GANG BLANK COVERS	100	EA	\$15.00
24	DUPLEX RECEPTACLE OUTLET PLATES	100	EA	\$20.00
25	3/4" EMT DIE CAST SET SCREW CONNECTORS	100	EA	\$20.00
26	1/2" CONDUIT CLIPS KADDY	50	EA	\$2.50
27	1/2" SINGLE GANG KO HANDY BOXES	50	EA	\$10.00
28	4 X 4 JUNCTION BOXES 1/2" & 3/4" KO -	50	EA	\$50.00
29	4 X 4 JUNCTION BOXES 1/2" & 3/4" KO - DEEP	50	EA	\$75.00
30	33 + SUPER 3/4 X 66 FT 3M TAPE	20	EA	\$74.00
31	120V EYE PHOTO CONTROL FIXED POSITION	10	EA	\$55.00
32	SINGLE POLE 120/277V SP20 A	50	EA	\$80.00
33	WIREMOLD SINGLE GANG BOXES - SHALLOW	10	EA	\$10.00
34	5/8" GROUND ROD	10	EA	\$145.00
35	FC6-1PC CRIMP ON COAX CONNECTORS	50	EA	\$2.00
36	V511 2-IN 90D WIREMOLD FLAT ELBOWS	10	EA	\$4.00
37	4 X 4 1/2" & 3/4" KO EXTRA DEEP JUCTION	30	EA	\$15.00
38	5/8" GROUND ROD CLAMPS	10	EA	\$24.50
39	3/4" PVC FEMALE CONNECTORS	50	EA	\$3.00
40	2" PLASTIC INSULATION BUSHINGS	30	EA	\$12.00
41	WIREMOLD FLUSH EXTENSION BOXES	10	EA	\$4.50
42	SINGLE RECEPTACLE NEMA6-20R WHIT/IV	50	EA	\$17.50
43	2SDTP-4 IV 10 FOOT POWER POLES	5	EA	\$173.50
44	V517 2-3/4 WIREMOLD INTERNAL ELBOWS	5	EA	\$2.75
45	V518 2-1/8 WIREMOLD EXTERNAL ELBOWS	5	EA	\$2.75
46	165 4 OCT 2-1/8 D OCTAGON JUNCTION BOXES	20	EA	\$15.00
47	35-YELLOW 3/4 X 66FT MARKING TAPE	10	EA	\$11.50
48	35-ORANGE 3/4 X 66FT MARKING TAPE	10	EA	\$11.50
49	35-BROWN 3/4 X 66FT MARKING TAPE	10	EA	\$11.50
50	DUPLEX NEMA5 15R RECEPTACLE OUTLETS	50	EA	\$50.00
51	PSA11 PLASTIC ANCHOR KITS W/ SCREWS	10	EA	\$75.00
52	2-IN SNAP-IN KO BLANK	10	EA	\$2.00
53	SINGLE OUTLET PLATES	30	EA	\$4.80
54	WHITE RANGE HOOD EXHAUST	5	EA	\$102.50
55	SINGLE RECEPTACLE NEMA5-20R WHIT/IV	50	EA	\$25.00
56	3/4" EMT DIE CAST COMPRESSION	50	EA	\$7.50
57	125V 40A TIMER	3	EA	\$22.35
58	WIREMOLD SINGLE GANG BOXES - SHALLOW	5	EA	\$2.75
	SUB-TOTAL ITEM V			\$3,909.00
	PRIMARY VENDOR GRAND TOTAL I. - VII.			→ \$7,445.45
	Miscellaneous Catalog Discount			Trade Service - 40 % off list

RECOMMENDATION →

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:

*M. Forbes*  
 MICHAEL FORBES, ASST. AUDITOR PURCHASING DATE 12/15/10

*Marcelino Ibarra*  
 MARCELINO IBARRA - BUILDING MAINTENANCE MANAGER

Approved by Com. Ct  
 12/21/2010